

**School Nutrition
Millington Municipal Schools, Lakeland School System and Arlington Community Schools
2019-2020**

	Item	Brand Label	Unit Size	Estimated Usage	Pack/Packer Code #	Bidder Item Cost #	Case or Specific Unit Cost	Fixed Fee per case or unit	Total Cost per Case or Unit	Extended Price
1	JUICE 100% - BERRY FLAVOR SINGLE SERVING WITH ATTACHED STRAW	CAPRI SUN	40 / 6 OZ	380	Kraft-14425	7525183	\$10.95	\$0.20	\$11.1500	\$4,237.0000
2	JUICE 100% - APPLE FLAVOR SINGLE SERVING WITH ATTACHED STRAW	CAPRI SUN	40 / 6 OZ	150	Kraft-01421	7525175	\$10.95	\$0.40	\$11.3500	\$1,702.5000
3	JUICE 100% - VARIOUS FLAVORS SINGLE SERVING WITH ATTACHED STRAW	CAPRI SUN	48 / 4.05 OZ	1000	Kraft/Heinz 9236	5075359- frit punch	\$9.74	\$0.35	\$10.0900	\$10,090.0000
4	APPLE SLICES - U.S. FANCY PACKED IN WATER	DISTRIBUTORS CHOICE	6 / #10 CAN	10	Sysco Classic/Knouse- FFSLR0600SY S02	1467968	\$36.79	\$1.50	\$38.2900	\$382.9000
5	APPLESAUCE - UNSWEETENED REGULAR (PUREED) NATURAL TEXTURE	DISTRIBUTORS CHOICE	6 / #10 CAN	250	Sysco Classic/Knouse- FFASU80000S YS02	1501238	\$25.88	\$1.35	\$27.2300	\$6,807.5000
6	CRANBERRY SAUCE JELLIED, GRADE A FCY	DISTRIBUTORS CHOICE	6 / #10 CAN	5	Sysco Imp/Clement pappas- 0100610sysimp	5729967	\$34.77	\$1.75	\$36.5200	\$182.6000
7	FRUIT COCKTAIL - U.S. CHOICE OR BETTER BULK PACKED IN EXTRA LIGHT SYRUP OR JUICE	DISTRIBUTORS CHOICE	6 / #10 CAN	75	Sysco classic/Pacific coast-2183368	2183368	\$44.03	\$1.50	\$45.5300	\$3,414.7500
8	MANDARIN ORANGES - SEGMENTS U.S. CHOICE OR BETTER BULK PACKED IN LIGHT SYRUP	DISTRIBUTORS CHOICE	6 / #10 CANS	400	Sysco Classic - 21074865N	3548385	\$39.01	\$1.60	\$40.6100	\$16,244.0000
9	PEACHES - SLICED, YELLOW CLING, GRADE A OR CHOICE PACKED IN 100% JUICE OR EXTRA LIGHT SYRUP	DISTRIBUTORS CHOICE	6 / #10 CANS	140	Sysco Classic/Pacific Coast- 2182063	2182063	\$42.46	\$1.65	\$44.1100	\$6,175.4000

10	PEARS - HALVES U.S. CHOICE OR BETTER BULK PACKED IN 100% PEAR JUICE OR EXTRA LIGHT SYRUP	DISTRIBUTORS CHOICE	6 / #10 CAN	50	Sysco Classic/Pacific Coast- 2182119	2182119	\$42.92	\$1.65	\$44.5700	\$2,228.5000
11	PINEAPPLE - TIDBITS U.S. CHOICE OR BETTER BULK PACKED IN 100% NATURAL JUICE	DISTRIBUTORS CHOICE	6 / #10 CAN	300	Sysco Supreme	4087409	\$30.40	\$1.45	\$31.8500	\$9,555.0000
12	RAISINS, FRUIT FLAVORED VARIOUS FLAVORS LIST FLAVORS:	CHAMPION 000527- 9,5290,5233 or Equal	200 / 1.50 OZ 200/1.66oz)	50	Champion- 0588(w/r/min shock)	7087169	\$54.83	\$1.70	\$56.5300	\$2,826.5000
					TOTAL DOLLAR AMOUNT					\$63,846.6500

School Nutrition
Millington Municipal Schools, Lakeland School System and Arlington Community Schools
2019-2020

Vegetables-Canned										
	All canned vegetable products should be lower in sodium with a goal of 140 mg or less per 1/2 cup serving unless specified otherwise. All products over 300 mg sodium per 1/2 cup serving must be pre-approved.									
	Item	Brand Label	Unit Size	Estimated Usage	Pack/packer Code #	Bidder Item Code #	Case or Specified Unit Cost	Fixed Fee per case or unit	Total Cost Per Case or Unit	Extended Price
1	BEAN- BAKED VEGETARIAN IN TOMATO SAUCE, GRADE A OR ABOVE	ALLEN, DEL MONTE, BUSH 1637 OR EQUAL	6 / #10 CAN	100	Bush-01637	5933718	\$30.24	\$0.95	\$31.1900	\$3,119.0000
2	BEANS - GREEN CUT, BLUE LAKE GRADE A FANCY, LOW SODIUM	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6 / #10 CAN	120	Sysco Classic/Seneca-062394	4062394	\$24.37	\$0.95	\$25.3200	\$3,038.4000
3	BEANS - TACO FIESTA BLACK BEANS	BUSH BEST	6 / #10 CAN	5	Bush-01585	3560127	\$35.44	\$1.40	\$36.8400	\$184.2000
4	BEANS - PINTO, GRADE A FCY, LOW SODIUM	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6 / #10 CAN	50	Casasolana classic/Teasdale-3362274	3362274	\$16.74	\$0.90	\$17.6400	\$882.0000
5	BEANS - PORK AND WHITE BEANS IN TOM. SAUCE	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6 / #10 CAN	30	Sysco Reliance/Hanover-2003334	4062204	\$19.69	\$0.90	\$20.5900	\$617.7000
6	CARROTS - SLICED SMALL, 1-1/2 IN DIAMETER, LOW SODIUM	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6 / #10 CAN	30	Allens/McCall-93213001	6562102	\$22.26	\$0.90	\$23.1600	\$694.8000
7	CORN - GOLDEN WHOLE KERNEL USD GRADE A OR BETTER, LOW SODIUM	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6 / #10 CAN	75	Libby/Seneca-F0323115	0323115	\$26.29	\$0.85	\$27.1400	\$2,035.5000
8	JALAPENO - SLICED	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6 / #10 CAN	10	Packer/rnson-4275020	4275020	\$24.53	\$1.00	\$25.5300	\$255.3000
9	MIXED VEGETABLES - US GRADE A CARROTS CORN PEAS GREEN BEANS LIMA BEANS LOW SODIUM	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6 / #10 CAN	20	Sysco Classic/Lakeside-7486510694	4112926	\$32.36	\$1.30	\$33.6600	\$673.2000

School Nutrition
Millington Municipal Schools, Lakeland School System and Arlington Community Schools
2019-2020

	Condiments: All items shall be 0 trans fat. Lower sodium products preferred for salad dressings and sauces with a goal of 250 mg sodium or less per one ounce serving. All seasonings shall be free from msg. All food items in this category must be documented with a Nutrition Fact Label and ingredient statement.									
	Item	Brand Label	Unit Size	Estimated Usage	Pack/Packer Code #	Bidder Item Code #	Case or Specified Unit Cost	Fixed Fee per case or unit	Total Cost Per Case or Unit	Extended Price
D1	BACON - BITS IMITATION BULK	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	1/10 LB	6	Sysco Reliance-46072	4062105	\$17.72	\$0.60	\$18.32	\$109.9200
D5	DRESSING - HONEY MUSTARD	MARZETTI OR EQUAL	4 /1 GAL	10	Sysco Classic/Bay Valley - 953262D0854	4537946	\$39.38	\$1.50	\$40.88	\$408.8000
D12	DRESSING - HONEY MUSTARD SINGLE SERVING CUP	NATURALLY FRESH 85116875061 OR APPROVED EQUAL	100 / 1 OZ	150	Naturally Fresh-85116875061	6284657	\$10.49	\$0.40	\$10.89	\$1,633.5000
D13	HONEY PURE, INDIVIDUAL CUP	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	200 / 12GM	5	House Recipe Classic/Diamond Crystal-78000619	3530128	\$23.93	\$0.80	\$24.73	\$123.6500
D14	HOT SAUCE PACKET	LOUISIANA 400015692 , OR TEXAS PETE	200 / 7GM	250	Louisiana-400015692	4335024	\$12.23	\$0.50	\$12.73	\$3,182.5000
D6	DRESSING - ITALIAN GOLDEN	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	4 / 1 GAL	15	Sysco Classic/Bay Valley- 953262D0854	4537946	\$39.38	\$1.50	\$40.88	\$613.2000
D7A	DRESSING - FAT FREE RANCH SINGLE SERVING	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	1 OZ PORTIONS	100	Marzetti-81976	5397260	\$9.70	\$0.40	\$10.10	\$1,010.0000
D7B	DRESSING - LITE RANCH SINGLE SERVING CUP	NATURALLY FRESH 85119775061 OR APPROVED EQUAL	100 / 1 OZ	225	Naturally Fresh-85119645061	5343181	\$9.48	\$0.30	\$9.78	\$2,200.5000
D10	DRESSING MIX - RANCH ORIGINAL	HIDDEN VALLEY 7110021004 OR APPROVED EQUAL	18 / 3.2 OZ	50	HVR-21004	6822561	\$21.46	\$0.90	\$22.36	\$1,118.0000
D15	JELLY - GRAPE SINGLE SERVING CUP	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	400 / .5 OZ	125	House Recipe Classic/Diamond Crystal-72426	2811834	\$19.85	\$0.75	\$20.60	\$2,575.0000
D16	JELLY - STRAWBERRY SINGLE SERVING CUP	DISTRBUTORS CHOICE	200 / .5 OZ	60	Smucker-5150001717	4457115	\$13.80	\$0.50	\$14.30	\$858.0000
D17	KETCHUP - U.S. GRADE SINGLE SERVING PACKETS	HEINZ OR APPROVED EQUAL	1000 / 9 GM	450	Sysco Classic/Heinz-130009866	4029500	\$15.16	\$0.30	\$15.46	\$6,957.0000
19	LEMON JUICE PKT 4 GM	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	500/CS	15	House Recipe Classic/Heinz-74865984	4460804	\$13.00	\$0.50	\$13.00	\$195.0000
D18	MARGARINE - UNSALTED, ZTF, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED	GOLDENSWEET OR APPROVED EQUAL	30 / 1 LB	50	Golden sweet Ventura-22048GNS	4583322	\$24.46	\$0.80	\$25.26	\$1,263.0000
D19	MARGARINE - INDIVIDUAL CUPS WHIPPED ZTF	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	432 / 14 GM	20	Shedd'sUnilever 4060050751	7295918	\$44.80	\$1.50	\$46.30	\$926.0000
D20	MAYONNAISE - SINGLE SERVE PKT	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	500 / 12GM	75	Sysco Classic/Heinz-74865000200	4219218	\$28.64	\$1.00	\$29.64	\$2,223.0000

D23	MUSTARD - PREPARED SINGLE SERVING PKT	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	1000 / 5.5 GM	75	House recipe Classic/Heinz-78000587	1608850	\$16.04	\$0.60	\$16.64	\$1,248.0000
D24A	OLIVES - BLACK SLICED	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6 / #10 CAN	5	Arezzo classic/Agro Sevilla-22003	1286319	\$43.28	\$1.80	\$45.08	\$225.4000
D24B	OLIVES GREEN SALAD	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	1 GALLON	10	Arezzo classic/Agro Sevilla-5875941	5875941K-split	\$11.49	\$0.50	\$11.99	\$119.9000
D26	PICKLE - DILL 1/8 KRINKLE CUT CHIP	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	4 / 1 GAL	20	Block & Barrel classic/Bay Valley-12722890185	4521621	\$22.92	\$0.95	\$23.87	\$477.4000
D27	PICKLE - SPEARS KOSHER DILL APPROX 80 CT PER CAN 6#10	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6 / #10 CAN	15	Bay Valley-12914951170	5821960	\$33.50	\$1.30	\$34.80	\$522.0000
D28	PICKLE - SWEET RELISH GRADE A	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	4 / 1 GAL	10	Block & Barrel reliance/Bay Valley-12803610181	4041125	\$26.21	\$1.10	\$27.31	\$273.1000
D30	PUDDING - VANILLA ZTF	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6 / #10 CAN	15	Sysco Classic/Bay Valley-79873220854	4011037	\$25.06	\$1.00	\$26.06	\$390.9000
D31	PUDDING - CHOCOLATE ZTF	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6 / #10 CAN	20	Sysco Classic/Bay Valley-79873230854	4011078	\$25.59	\$1.00	\$26.59	\$531.8000
D32	SAUCE - BARBECUE ORIGINAL MILD	CATTLEMAN OR APPROVED EQUAL	4 / 1 GAL	35	Cattleman/McCormick k 410531681	4005526	\$36.29	\$1.40	\$37.69	\$1,319.1500
D33	SAUCE - BBQ INDIV PACKET	KRAFT OR APPROVED EQUAL	500 / 12GM	100	PPI/Heinz-716037278205	4089678	\$13.56	\$0.50	\$14.06	\$1,406.0000
D34	SAUCE - WING BUFFALO RTU	FRANKS OR EQUAL	4 / 1 GAL	10	Franks/McCormick-417416104	6404743	\$42.77	\$1.60	\$44.37	\$443.7000
D35	SAUCE - CHEESE CHEDDAR LOWFAT	LUCKY LEAF OR APPROVED EQUAL	6 / #10 CAN	70	Lucky Leaf/Knouse-FFCSL0808LKL01	6310841-special order	\$39.62	\$1.60	\$41.22	\$2,885.4000
D45	SAUCE - QUESO BLANCO WHITE SAUCE - APPROX 30LBS PER CASE SAMPLE REQUIRED	LAND OF LAKES 39944, 48238000034500 OR QUESO BRAVO 48238000034500	6 / 106 OZ	20	LOL-39944000034500	1547427	\$68.44	\$2.85	\$71.29	\$1,425.8000
D37	SAUCE - SOY SINGLE SERVING PKT	KIKOMAN OR APPROVED EQUAL	200 / 5 OZ	5	Kikkoman-2653	4239851	\$6.85	\$0.40	\$7.25	\$36.2500
D38	SAUCE - SWEET & SOUR SINGLE SERVING CUP	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	100 / 1 OZ	45	Chatsworth/Heinz-7160374494400	4915575	\$8.89	\$0.40	\$9.29	\$418.0500
D39	SAUCE - TACO MILD SINGLE SERVING	HEINZ 532409 OR APPROVED EQUAL	200 / 9 GM	120	Heinz-532409	4893467	\$9.30	\$0.30	\$9.60	\$1,152.0000
D40	SAUCE - TARTAR SINGLE SERVING	HEINZ OR APPROVED EQUAL	200 / 12 GM	20	Heinz-531600	4533535	\$10.67	\$1.00	\$11.67	\$233.4000
D41	SOUR CREAM - REAL FAT FREE SINGLE SERVING 1 OZ	LAND OF LAKES OR EQUAL	100 / 1 OZ	15	LOL-64407000034500	8386023	\$13.59	\$1.00	\$14.59	\$218.8500
D42	SOUR CREAM - REAL, SINGLE SERVING 1 OZ	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	100 / 1 OZ	25	Wholesome Farms Classic/Schreiber-00306	5031836	\$15.23	\$0.55	\$15.78	\$394.5000
43	SUGAR PACKET 1/10 OZ	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	2000/CS	5	Sysco Classic/Domino-4000899	4000899	\$12.18	\$0.50	\$12.68	\$63.4000
44	SUGAR SUB PACKET PINK 1/GM	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	2000/CS	5	Sweetplus/Sugar-82051	6115315	\$14.57	\$0.60	\$15.17	\$75.8500
D43	SYRUP - MAPLE SINGLE SERVING CUP	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	100 / 1 5 OZ	350	Pocopa/Diamond Crystal- 86448	7748573	\$8.80	\$0.40	\$9.20	\$3,220.0000
D44	WHIPPED DESSERT TOPPING - NON DAIRY PLAIN IN BAGS FROZEN READY TO USE	RICH'S ON TOP 2559 OR EQUAL	12 / 16 OZ	20	Richs- 02559	1169960	\$31.13	\$1.30	\$32.43	\$648.6000
						TOTAL DOLLAR AMOUNT				\$43,126.5200

Special order

School Nutrition
Millington Municipal Schools, Lakeland School System and Arlington Community Schools
2019-2020

Storeroom: Please note that all items must be trans fat free and all grain products must be whole grain rich as defined by the USDA. Spices & Seasonings: All seasonings shall be free from msg. All food items in this category must be documented with a Nutrition Fact Label and ingredient statement.										
	Item	Brand Label	Unit Size	Estimated Usage	Pack/Packer Code #	Bidder Item Code #	Case or Specified Unit Cost	Fixed Fee per case or unit	Total Cost Per Case or Unit	Extended Price
1	BAKING POWDER - DOUBLE ACTING	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	10 LB	1	Clabber girl- 00355	4040598K-split	\$15.64	\$0.50	\$16.1400	\$16.1400
2	BAKING SODA	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	12/24 OZ	1	Abmauri-2438	5201112	\$22.10	\$0.85	\$22.9500	\$22.9500
3	BASE - SOUP BEEF LOW SODIUM FIRST INGREDIENT MUST BE BEEF	KNORR 84150966 OR EQUAL	6/1LB	5	Knorr-67521943	4084945	\$49.62	\$2.00	\$51.6200	\$258.1000
4	BASE - SOUP CHICKEN ONLY CHICKEN FIRST OR SECOND INGREDIENT LOW SODIUM	KNORR 84150742 OR EQUAL	6 / 1 LB	15	Knorr-67521941	4084931	\$48.87	\$2.00	\$50.8700	\$763.0500
5	BASE - HAM NO MSG LOW SODIUM	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6 / 1 LB	5	Sysco Imperial/Ventura-72817sys	4944724	\$32.23	\$1.30	\$33.5300	\$167.6500
6	CHEESECAKE MIX	JELLO 43000826208 OR EQUAL	6 / 4 LB	5	Jello/Kraft-43000826208	4036489	\$68.59	\$2.80	\$71.3900	\$356.9500
7	COCOA POWDER 10-12% BFAT	DISTIBUTORS CHOICE	6 / 5 LB	5	Chefcomplete/Diamond Crystal-58229	5792684	\$93.48	\$3.80	\$97.2800	\$486.4000
8	COFFEE - REGULAR, GROUND	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6 / 2#	2	Citavo Classic-3473022146	7887041	\$52.12	\$2.00	\$54.1200	\$108.2400
9	COOKIE - VANILLA WAFER	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6 / 13.3 OZ	8	Keebler--3010040865	4240362	\$9.85	\$0.40	\$10.2500	\$82.0000
10	CORN STARCH	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	24 / 1 LB	1	Argo-07132	4032991	\$16.68	\$0.70	\$17.3800	\$17.3800
11	CORNMEAL- YELLOW SELF RISING	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	25 LB	10	Sunflower-7452	5536461	\$7.90	\$0.40	\$8.3000	\$83.0000
12	CRACKER CRUMB GRAHAM	KEEBLER 3010015347 OR EQUAL	1 / 10 LB	5	Keebler- 3010015347	4009601	\$17.04	\$0.70	\$17.7400	\$88.7000
13	DRESSING - SALAD WHIPPED	DISTIBUTORS CHOICE	4 / 1 GAL	8	Sysco reliance/Southern Classic-85107411rel	4002473	\$22.82	\$0.85	\$23.6700	\$189.3600
14	FLAVORING - VANILLA IMITATION	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	32 OZ	5	Sysco Classic/McCormick-974398	5239389K-split	\$4.80	\$0.20	\$5.0000	\$25.0000

15	FLOUR-ALL PURPOSE ENRICHED PACKED	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	25 LB	10	Sysco Classic/GM-52125000	8379251	\$6.38	\$0.25	\$6.6300	\$66.3000
16	FOOD COLORING - YELLOW	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	16 OZ	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.0000	\$0.0000
17	GELATIN - LIME	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	12 / 24 OZ	5	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.0000	\$0.0000
18	GELATIN - ORANGE	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	12 / 24 OZ	5	Sysco Classic/Diamond Crystal-53659	4010443	\$26.53	\$1.00	\$27.5300	\$137.6500
19	GELATIN - CHERRY	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	12 / 24 OZ	5	Sysco Classic/Diamond Crystal-53642	4010351	\$26.65	\$1.00	\$27.6500	\$138.2500
20	GRAVY MIX - BROWN INSTANT ZTF	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6/15 OZ	8	Sysco Imperial /guenther-92175	8558215	\$18.04	\$0.75	\$18.7900	\$150.3200
21	GRAVY MIX - CHICKEN INSTANT ZTF	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6/14 OZ	5	Sysco Imperial /Guenther-92061	4933933	\$20.00	\$0.80	\$20.8000	\$104.0000
22	KETCHUP-U.S. GRADE A FANCY 33% SOLIDS	HUNTS/RED GOLD OR DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6 / #10 CANS OR 67LB POUCH	8	Sysco Imperial/red Gold-SYY599	5096409	\$20.43	\$0.80	\$21.2300	\$169.8400
23	LEMON JUICE-FROM CONCENTRATE BULK	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	12/32 OZ	8	Sahara B/Clement pappas -3201232SB	0475394	\$27.47	\$1.05	\$28.5200	\$228.1600
24	MARSHMALLOWS-MINI BULK	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	12 / 16 OZ	5	Sysco Classic- 95000	4080966	\$21.06	\$0.80	\$21.8600	\$109.3000
25	MAYONNAISE - HEAVY DUTY	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	4/1 GAL	100	Sysco Reliance/Southern Classic - 92107411rel	4002432	\$21.98	\$1.00	\$22.9800	\$2,298.0000
26	MAYONNAISE-REDUCED CALORIE BULK	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	4/ 1 GAL	1	Kraft- 10021000643018	3716685	\$31.82	\$1.30	\$33.1200	\$33.1200
27	MILK - DRY NON FAT BULK NOT MORE THAN 25 LB	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	25 LB	3	Sysco Classic - 4231528	4231528	\$48.07	\$2.00	\$50.0700	\$150.2100
28	MIX - CAKE WHITE COMPLETE MIX W/ WATER ONLY	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6 / 5 LB	8	Sysco reliance/Continental Mills-5301601	5301601	\$21.45	\$0.85	\$22.3000	\$178.4000
29	MIX - CAKE DEVILS FOOD COMPLETE MIX WATER ONLY	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6 / 5 LB	8	Sysco reliance/Continental Mills-1242985	1242985	\$23.46	\$0.85	\$24.3100	\$194.4800
30	MUSTARD - YELLOW PREPARED	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	4 / 1 GAL	2	Sysco Classic/Wisconsin Spice-40007	4006797	\$21.58	\$0.85	\$22.4300	\$44.8600
31	OIL - OLIVE	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	1 GAL	5	Arezzo Classic-5934302	5934302K-split	\$8.82	\$0.35	\$9.1700	\$45.8500

32	OIL - 100% VEGETABLE NO SOY OR PEANUT	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6 / 1 GL	1	Sysco Classic/Ventura- 99904COM	4119061	\$33.77	\$1.50	\$35.2700	\$35.2700
33	ONION DEHYDRATED MINCED	MCCORMICK OR DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	1/15 LB	5	McCormick-979608	5013974	\$49.90	\$2.00	\$51.9000	\$259.5000
34	PAN COATING - CANOLA OIL 450F NO FLAVOR	PAM 6414463111	6 / 17 OZ	20	Pam/Conagra- 6414463111	4583290	\$13.84	\$0.60	\$14.4400	\$288.8000
35	PAN/FOOD SPRAY - CANOLA OIL BUTTER FLAVORED	BUTTERBUDS 56217 OR EQUAL	6 / 17 OZ	20	Butterbuds-56217	7002606	\$20.87	\$0.85	\$21.7200	\$434.4000
36	PECANS - RAW PIECES MEDIUM	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	1 / 5 LB	5	Sysco Classic/John B Sanfilippo-S4645396	4889291	\$45.76	\$1.95	\$47.7100	\$238.5500
37	PIMENTO - UNPEELED DICED WATER PACKED WITH CITRIC ACID	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	24 / 28 OZ(12/28oz)	20	Sysco Imperial/Moody Dunbar- 0708441112030	5240124	\$35.74	\$1.45	\$37.1900	\$743.8000
38	RAISINS - SEEDLESS DARK	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	1 / 30 LB	3	Sysco Imperial/Rema food-3463595	3386712	\$61.54	\$2.25	\$63.7900	\$191.3700
39	SALT FREE 17	LAWRY'S 2150080606 OR APPROVED EQUAL	6 / 20 OZ	20	Lawrys/McCormick- 2150080606	4982963	\$76.21	\$2.75	\$78.9600	\$1,579.2000
40	SALT PKT .6 GM	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6/1000CT	5	Sysco Classic/Diamond Crystal-14375	4123196	\$9.56	\$0.30	\$9.8600	\$49.3000
41	SALT GRANULATED IODIZED ROUND	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	24 / 26 OZ	10	Supiors/Cargill salt- 52010-11000	5232719	\$11.90	\$0.50	\$12.4000	\$124.0000
42	SAUCE - ORANGE LESS SODIUM	MINH 69143 OR EQUAL	4 / 3 LB(5/6#)	5	Minh/Schwans- 69143	2030852	\$42.23	\$1.70	\$43.9300	\$219.6500
43	SAUCE - GENERAL TSO	MINOR OR APPROVED EQUAL	4 / .5 GAL	6	Minor/Nestle- 5000313105USL	6031741	\$51.03	\$2.10	\$53.1300	\$318.7800
44	SAUCE MIX - ALFREDO	TRIO OR EQUAL	8 / 16 OZ	45	Trio/Nestle- 10050000385024	5435177	\$71.73	\$2.60	\$74.3300	\$3,344.8500
45	SEASONING MIX - CHILI LOWER SODIUM	LAWRY'S 2150080526 OR EQUAL	6 / 5.7 OZ	45	Lawrys/McCormick- 2150080526	5444039	\$18.70	\$0.70	\$19.4000	\$873.0000
46	SEASONING MIX - FAJITA LOWER SODIUM	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6 / 8.9 OZ	10	Lawrys/McCormick- 2150080091	4825121	\$22.86	\$0.95	\$23.8100	\$238.1000
47	SEASONING MIX - SLOPPY JOE LOWER SODIUM	LAWRY'S 2150080570 OR EQUAL	6 / 15 OZ	10	Lawrys/McCormick- 2150080570	4044178	\$21.32	\$0.75	\$22.0700	\$220.7000
48	SEASONING MIX - SPAGHETTI	LAWRY'S 2150080545 OR EQUAL	6 / 12 OZ	30	Lawrys/McCormick- 2150080545	4989968	\$24.34	\$1.00	\$25.3400	\$760.2000
49	SEASONING MIX - TACO NO MSG	LAWRY'S 2150080110 OR EQUAL	6 / 9 OZ	100	Lawrys/McCormick- 2150080110	4069217	\$18.87	\$0.75	\$19.6200	\$1,962.0000

usage changed

Special order

Special order

50	SEASONING - 100% NATURAL BUTTER FLAVOR GRANULES FAT FREE LOWER SODIUM	BUTTER BUDS 49835	24 / 4 OZ	5	Butterbuds-49835	0911537	\$30.87	\$1.25	\$32.1200	\$160.6000
51	SHORTENING - LIQUID CLEAR BULK ZERO TRANS FAT	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	1/ 35 LB	3	Sysco reliance/Bunge oil-5020553	4518403	\$18.30	\$0.75	\$19.0500	\$57.1500
52	SOUP - CREAM OF MUSHROOM CONDENSED	CAMPBELLS OR EQUAL	12 / 50 OZ	5	Campbell-000001266	4040382	\$43.32	\$2.30	\$45.6200	\$228.1000
53	SOUP - LOWER SODIUM CONDENSED CREAM OF CHICKEN	CAMPBELLS 1036 OR EQUAL	12 / 50 OZ	10	Campbell-000001036	4040325	\$43.68	\$1.80	\$45.4800	\$454.8000
54	SOUP - TOMATO	CAMPBELLS 16 OR EQUAL	12 / 50 OZ	5	Campbell-000000016	4040390	\$33.24	\$1.30	\$34.5400	\$172.7000
55	SPICE - CRUSHED BASIL LEAVES	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	20 OZ(22oz)	1	Imp/Mcc/mccormick-900386871	8173397K-split	\$17.21	\$0.70	\$17.9100	\$17.9100
56	SPICE - CRUSHED PARSLEY LEAVES	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	12 OZ	1	Badia-00033844906030	5467075K-split	\$5.59	\$0.30	\$5.8900	\$5.8900
57	SPICE - CHILI POWDER	BADIA OR EQUAL	5.5 LB	1	Badia- 842	5921467K-split	\$16.34	\$0.70	\$17.0400	\$17.0400
58	SPICE - GARLIC POWDER	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	1 LB	30	Sysco Classic/McCormick-974071	5239611K-split	\$4.34	\$0.15	\$4.4900	\$134.7000
59	SPICE - GROUND BLACK PEPPER	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	5 LB	5	Sysco Classic-McCormick- 974516	5935689K-split	\$33.79	\$1.30	\$35.0900	\$175.4500
60	SPICE - PEPPER WHITE GROUND	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	18 OZ	5	Sysco Classic/McCormick-900029940	5327459K-split	\$11.09	\$0.45	\$11.5400	\$57.7000
61	SPICE- PEPPER PACKET .1GM	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	61000	3	Sysco Classic/Diamond crystal- 14480	4123212	\$23.83	\$1.00	\$24.8300	\$74.4900
62	SPICE - GROUND CELERY SEED	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	1 LB	2	Imp/Mcc/McCormick - 974243	5228499K-split	\$7.02	\$0.30	\$7.3200	\$14.6400
63	SPICE - GROUND CINNAMON	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	18 OZ	2	Sysco Classic/McCormick-900029825	5265451K-split	\$4.62	\$0.20	\$4.8200	\$9.6400
64	SPICE - GROUND CUMIN SEED	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	14 OZ	1	Sysco Classic/McCormick-974065	5239553K-split	\$3.79	\$0.15	\$3.9400	\$3.9400
65	SPICE - GROUND DRY MUSTARD	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	1 LB	3	Imp/Mcc/mcCormick-974297	5229026K-split	\$5.45	\$0.25	\$5.7000	\$17.1000
66	SPICE - GROUND NUTMEG	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	1 LB	3	imp/mcc/McCormick-974301	5229067K-split	\$13.49	\$0.50	\$13.9900	\$41.9700
67	SPICE - GROUND PAPRIKA	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	1 LB	1	Sysco Classic/McCormick-974086	5236674K-split	\$3.92	\$0.15	\$4.0700	\$4.0700

68	SPICE - ONION POWDER	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	20 OZ	15	Sysco Classic/McCormick- 974511	5935648K- split	\$3.95	\$0.15	\$4,1000	\$61,5000
69	SPICE - SAGE RUBBED	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6 OZ	1	Imp/Mcc/McCormick- 974361	5229653K- split	\$8.55	\$0.35	\$8,9000	\$8,9000
70	SPICE - POULTRY	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	12 OZ	3	Imp/mcco/Cormick- 974352	5229562K- split	\$9.73	\$0.40	\$10,1300	\$30,3900
71	SPICE BLEND - LEMON AND PEPPER SALT FREE	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6 / 1.5 OZ	1	Badia- 00033844906177	5921780	\$20.90	\$0.70	\$21,6000	\$21,6000
72	SUGAR - BROWN LIGHT CANE	DOMINO 401358 OR EQUAL	24 / 1 LB	20	Domino-401358	4281440	\$23.80	\$13.00	\$36,8000	\$736,0000
73	SUGAR - GRANULATED WHITE FINE BULK	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	50 LB	50	Sysco Classic/Domino- 403434	4782694	\$28.70	\$1.10	\$29,8000	\$1,490,0000
74	SUGAR - POWDERED CONFECTIONER 10X CANE	DOMINO 401367 OR EQUAL	12/1 LB(24/1#)	5	domino-401367	4286282	\$23.78	\$0.95	\$24,7300	\$123,6500
75	SYRUP CORN LIGHT W/VANILLA	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	4/1 GAL	2	Sysco Classic/Lyons Magnus-0180	5296504	\$34.83	\$1.35	\$36,1800	\$72,3600
76	TEA - BAGS PLAIN FLAVOR ONE OZ TO YIELD ONE GALLON	HOUSE RECIPE 29628 OR EQUAL	96 / 1 OZ	25	House recipe Classic- 29628	4202255	\$17.53	\$0.75	\$18,2800	\$457,0000
77	VINEGAR - APPLE CIDER FLAVORED BULK	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	6/1 GAL	2	Heinz- 10013000007624	4296653	\$18.04	\$0.75	\$18,7900	\$37,5800
78	VINEGAR - DISTILLED WHITE	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	4 / 1 GAL	5	Sysco Classic/Mizkan- 10074865106976	4113049	\$12.12	\$0.50	\$12,6200	\$63,1000
79	YEAST - INSTANT ACTING	DISTRIBUTOR'S CHOICE	1 LB	1	LeSaffre- 15909	9407792K- split	\$2.32	\$1.65	\$3,9700	\$3,9700
TOTAL DOLLAR AMOUNT									\$23,349.0700	