MILK AND DAIRY PRODUCTS

BID #FY22016

VENDOR Hiland Dairy Foods
TERMS Net 21
ITEM # UNIT Qry. DESCRIPTION
1 1/2 Gallon 1,359:Buttermilk
Unit Price 2.7515
Total Price 3,739.29
2 1/2 Pint 283,016:1% White
Unit Price 0.3600
Total Price 101,885.76
3 Gallon 600:1% White
Unit Price 5.0119
Total Price 3,007.14
4 1/2 Pint 2,954 :FF Lactaid
Unit Price 0.7700
Total Price 2,274.58
5 1/2 Pint 250:FF Chocolate
Unit Price 0.3750
Total Price 93.75
6 1/2 Pint 250:FF Strawberry
Unit Price 0.3750
Total Price 93.75
7 1/2 Pint 250:FF Vanilla Shake No Bid
Unit Price -
Total Price -
8 1/2 Pint 300:FF Unflavored
Unit Price 0.3600
Total Price 108.00
9 1/2 Pint 1,400,534:1% Chocolate
Unit Price 0.3650
Total Price 511,194.91
10 1/2 Pint 33,421:1% Strawberry
Unit Price 0.3650
Total Price 12,198.67
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MILK AND DAIRY PRODUCTS
BID #FY22016

ITEM # UNIT Qry. DESCRIPTION
11 1/2 Pint 36,419:1% Vanilla
Unit Price: S 0.3650 : $
Total Pricei $ 13,292.94 : S
12 3 LB. Tub 190:1% Lowfat Cottage Cheese
Unit Pricei $ 6.2500 i S
Total Pricei S 1,187.50 | S
13 5LB Tub 300:Lowfat Yogurt
Unit Price: S 7.2200: S
Total Pricei $ 2,166.00: S
14 3 LB Tub 242:Reduced Fat Sour Cream
Unit Price: $ 6.2000 i S
Total Price: S 1,500.40 ;| S
15 300:FF White Plastic Chub No Bid
Unit Pricei S - S
Total Price: $ - $
16 300:FF Strawberry Plastic Chub No Bid
Unit Price: $ - S
Total Pricei S - S
17 300:FF Chocolate Plastic Chub No Bid
Unit Pricei $§ - S
Total Price: $ - $
18 300:1% White Plastic Chub No Bid
Unit Price: $ - S
Total Price; S - S
19 300:1% Chocolate Chub No Bid
Unit Pricei $§ - S
Total Price $ - S
20 300:1% Strawberry Chub No Bid
Unit Pricei $ - S
Total Price: S - S
| GRAND TOTAL (Items 1- 20) | $ 652,742.68 | $
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